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Jan Pickrel is EPA’s National Pretreatment Program Coordinator in the Water Permits 
Division of the Office of Wastewater Management (OWM) as well as the OWM Climate 
Change Coordinator. She coordinates the implementation issues regarding industrial 
wastewater permits and the development of technology-based effluent guidelines and 
categorical standards with EPA’s Office of Science and Technology and other EPA 
offices. She has taught over 30 intensive courses and webinars on the pretreatment 
program across the nation with the Water Environment Federation and spoken at many 
other venues on the development and implementation of pretreatment programs and 
the regulation of industrial wastewater discharges.  

Prior to coming to EPA’s Office of Wastewater Management in 1997, Jan worked for 13 
years at Virginia Department of Environmental Quality’s Northern Virginia Regional 
Office, where she served as the Pretreatment Coordinator and Senior Environmental 
Engineer with the region’s VPDES Program. During her tenure at VDEQ, she also 
served as the Chief Regional Geologist and has extensive experience in land 
application of biosolids, ground water and surface water investigations, and oil spill 
remediation efforts.  

Ms. Pickrel received her B.S. in Geology from the College of William and Mary and a 
Masters of Engineering Administration from George Washington University. 
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Chuck Durham is a Principal Engineer and Project Manager for Tetra Tech, Inc., and 
has over 22 years of regulatory experience in the water pollution control field with 
emphasis on the federal pretreatment program and industrial wastewater. Since joining 
Tetra Tech in 2001, Mr. Durham has conducted more than 150 pretreatment audits and 
inspections across 5 EPA Regions and 9 States. In addition, Mr. Durham has developed 
and implemented pretreatment training courses for 12 States in 5 EPA Regions. Prior to 
joining Tetra Tech, Mr. Durham served as a Program Manager for the Tennessee 
Division of Water Pollution Control. Responsibilities included oversight of the 
pretreatment program, biosolids program, plans review, and technical support. He is the 
Committee Chair for the KY-TN WEA Pretreatment Certification Program.  

Mr. Durham received his B.S. in Mechanical Engineering from Tennessee 
Technological University. 

 


